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the goal of codejock software is to provide our users with the most
intuitive set of user interface components that we can provide for the

price we can offer. in addition, we do not want to charge any more
than necessary for a set of components and functionality that we

offer. for this reason we cannot offer a package that includes
commercial support, maintenance, versions upgrades and upgrades.
given the combined amount of toolkitpro and suitepro components,

controls, classes, interfaces and environements they can be
instantiated in and used from, it is not only impossible to produce

tutorials and walkthroughs for all, and especially narrow, use cases, it
is impossible even to imagine and count those use cases. also

providing such a comprehensive documentation comes at a price of a
very expensive maintenance and keeping it up to date. shifting focus

from improving and development to producing detailed
documentation would inevitably result in reducing, or even halting,

most future functional updates. the xtreme toolkit pro edition
samples, help you to create a variety of rich gui controls that will give

your application a professional, professional look and feel. you can
use our samples to create menus, toolbars, buttons, navigation bars

and even entire windows! the xtreme toolkit professional edition
integrates our most useful, most powerful controls with the most open
source libraries and frameworks. we have a professional, professional
look and feel with our own icons and themes. we can easily change

the look and feel of our controls, use our own, or import your own. we
have powerful controls that let you create more control than you ever
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thought possible.
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the xtreme toolkit professional edition's support for wpf, windows
forms, and asp.net is only second to microsoft. you can use these
technologies to create a variety of rich controls that will give your

application a professional, professional look and feel. you can use our
samples to create menus, toolbars, buttons, navigation bars and even
entire windows! the xtreme toolkit professional edition samples, help

you to create a variety of rich gui controls that will give your
application a professional, professional look and feel. you can use our
samples to create menus, toolbars, buttons, navigation bars and even

entire windows! xtreme toolkit pro for visual c++ mfc is a powerful
toolkit for creating professional, fully-functional, graphical, user

interfaces for windows applications using microsoft visual c++ mfc.
xtp features include: inclusion of visual studio style docking panes

and office style ribbons, toolbars, and menus to give your application
a modern appearance. mfc gui creation utilities to help you create

and manage the windows controls you need. a complete set of
samples with source code, that you can use as a starting point for

your own projects. ive been using xtp for over a year and am
extremely impressed with how easy it is to use, and how professional
ive made my windows application look in a short period of time. your
developers provide great sample programs, as well as excellent and
timely feedback in your forums. one of the biggest problems we face
at visual studio is how quickly and completely new technologies are
absorbed, made use of, and integrated into visual studio. i've been

looking for a toolkit that allows us to create professional applications
without having to learn a new set of interfaces, tools, and methods.
xtreme toolkit pro v16 for visual studio is exactly what i have been

looking for and it is as easy to use as visual studio itself, but has the
power and flexibility of a traditional windows application. 5ec8ef588b
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